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xtensive research findings pre-
sented by the World Comm-
ission on Dams have shown

that between 40 and 80 million peo-
ple have been forced to leave their
homes as a result of the construction
of large hydroelectric dams alone.1

In 1994 the government of India
admitted that 10 million people dis-
placed by dams, mines, deforestation
and other development projects were
still ‘awaiting rehabilitation’, a figure
regarded as very conservative by most

independent researchers. In China the
government has admitted that 7 mil-
lion development-induced IDPs lived
in ‘extreme poverty’ in 1989.2

When the lives of so many people are
being disrupted, why is there such
deafening silence surrounding devel-
opment-induced IDPs? During the last
decade the UN has gradually paid
more attention to conflict-induced
displacement, belatedly recognising
that IDPs are just as vulnerable as
refugees and by far outnumber those

who have fled across a border. What
is now required to direct the interna-
tional community’s attention to the
development- induced displaced? Will
they remain silent victims of govern-
ment and corporate neglect? This
article draws attention to forced dis-
placement as a violation of human
rights, looking both at how develop-
ment at projects cause displacement
and the widespread neglect of dis-
placed populations in need of
resettlement and restitution of 
livelihoods.

The UN Guiding Principles
and development-induced
displacement

Francis Deng, the UN Secretary
General’s Special Representative on

Development-induced
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international human rights issue?
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If the exact number of conflict-induced IDPs is
unclear (most observers agree there are 20-25 
million), the number of those displaced by 
development projects is even harder to estimate.
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IDPs, has been instrumental in draw-
ing international attention to the
plight of conflict-induced IDPs. 
His work has contributed to the
improvement of government and UN
responses to conflict-induced IDPs.
The set of international norms – the
UN Guiding Principles on Internal
Displacement – developed by him and
his legal team may not be internation-
al binding law but are based on
international human rights and
humanitarian law. 

In order to see what scope there is for
the Principles to be used to address
the plight of development-induced
displaced persons, we need first to
determine if the Guiding Principles
actually apply to development-
induced IDPs. A quick reading of the
definition of a displaced person in the
Guiding Principles shows this is not
immediately apparent. It states that:

“Internally displaced persons are per-
ons or groups of persons who have
been forced or obliged to flee or to
leave their homes or places of habitual
residence, in particular as a result of
or in order to avoid the effects of
armed conflict, situations of generalized
violence, violations of human rights or
natural or human-made disasters, and
who have not crossed an internationally
recognized State border.” 

However, the expression “in particu-
lar” before the listing of the causes
indicates that the list is not exhaus-
tive. Francis Deng and Roberta Cohen
have argued that the construction of
hydroelectric dams could be consid-
ered a “human-made disaster” and
therefore that those displaced fall
within the definition in the Guiding
Principles.3

The case for arguing that develop-
ment-induced displacement is clearly
covered by the Principles is bolstered
by Principle 6.2(c ) which reads: 

“The prohibition of arbitrary displace-
ment includes displacement: […]
(c) In cases of large-scale development
projects, which are not justified by
compelling and overriding public 
interests […]”

But what is meant by the ambiguous
concept of “compelling and overriding
public interests”? Who has authority
to adjudicate that “compelling and

overriding public interest” can justify
forcing people off their lands? 

Walter Kalin, one of the drafters of
the Guiding Principles, has suggested
that “development-related displace-
ment is permissible only when
compelling and overriding public
interests jus-
tify this
measure,
that is, when the requirements of
necessity and proportionality are
met”.4 For an interpretation of the last
concepts, the “requirements of neces-
sity and proportionality”, Kalin refers
to the World Bank’s Operational
Directive 4.30 on Involuntary
Resettlement5 and the OECD’s
Guidelines for Aid Agencies on
Involuntary Displacement and
Resettlement in Development Projects. 

However, though these guidelines pro-
vide excellent guidance to
governments, aid agencies and
lenders on involuntary resettlement
and rehabilitation of populations dis-
placed by development projects, they
do not shed further light on the issue
of “necessity and proportionality”.
These concepts are therefore left to
be worked out by those who should
apply the Guiding Principles: govern-
ments, non-state actors, UN agencies
and the Representative of the
Secretary General himself.

Deconstructing the language
of development-induced 
displacement

Because “overriding public interest”
and “necessity and proportionality”
determine whether forced displace-
ment of a population as a con-
sequence of an infrastructure project
is a human rights violation or a
legitimate development project, it is
important to reflect on these words.
We need to continue challenging the
assumptions behind the words used to
justify large-scale forced displacement.

Who is “the public”? If we accept that
international human rights are univer-
sal in scope it follows that the
“public” is the whole population in a
given area and not only the economic
and political elite. To take the exam-
ple of India (where more than 80% of
rural households have no electricity)
one could argue that expanding the
electricity supply network in rural

areas would be more “necessary” than
producing more electricity for a most-
ly urban elite.6 This argument is
backed by the World Commission on
Dams’ conclusion that large dams
“produce benefits that accrue to
groups other than those who bear the
social and environ-mental costs”.7

Could “proportionality” be made more
quantifiable? In the case of a hydro-
electric project the authorities could
determine a “justifiable” number of
households-to-be displaced per pro-
jected megawatt produced. Of course,
such a cynical method of determining
proportionality assumes that the elec-
tricity produced will benefit the
population equally – clearly not the
case where a small minority enjoy
access to electricity.

If the displaced are not properly reset-
tled and their capacity to earn a living
is not restored to them, it becomes
irrelevant if the project forcing them
off their land is of an “overriding pub-
lic interest”. It is still the reality that
their rights have still been violated. 

UN lack of interest in 
development-induced
displacement

It has been left to NGOs, the media
and academics to probe the govern-
ment-inflicted human rights abuses
related to development-induced dis-
placement and to highlight the plight
of millions of IDPs forced off their
land. If, as we have seen, the Guiding
Principles and binding international
human rights law8 prohibit forced dis-
placement (conflict– or development-
induced) not justified by overriding
public interest, why is the UN so hesi-
tant to address the issue? How can
the international community justify,
for example, the fact that in Georgia
UNHCR has for the past decade
attended to the needs of 272,000 rela-
tively well-off conflict-induced IDPs
while at least 21 million development-
induced displaced in India are not
even an issue to UNHCR (or to any
other UN agency)?

Governments naturally fight harder to
maintain the concept of national sov-
ereignty when the perpetrator of
displacement is the state itself.
Governments are generally more likely

why is the UN so hesitant to address the issue?



to allow the international community
access to displaced populations when
the majority of IDPs have been dis-
placed by non-state actors as in
Colombia or Angola. When, however,
the state is heavily involved (as in
Burma, China or Russia), access is
very limited. This lack of access is, to
some extent, now being challenged by
the UN in situations where the victims
are displaced by conflict. We are yet
to see similar UN pressure when dis-
placement occurs as a result of
development projects. 

The reason for this indifference is to
be found in the UN’s interpretation of:
i) a legitimate development project of
overriding public interest, protected
from international interference by the
concept of national sovereignty, and
ii) a human rights violation of concern
to the international community. 
In the case of India, are we not clearly
looking at the latter? Interpreting the
displacement of millions of people in
terms of national sovereignty, the UN
has not addressed the issue with the
government of India or, for that mat-
ter, with any other government. 

Is it not time to more energetically
pursue UN Secretary General Kofi
Annan’s idea that national sovereignty
comes with certain human rights
responsibilities towards the citizen of
a truly sovereign country?9 The argu-
ment made by the US Committee for
Refugees in relation to conflict-
induced displacement in India is just
as valid in relation to development
IDP: “India cannot, however, fail to
take steps to protect and assist the
displaced, prevent others from doing
so, and yet reject the international
community’s humanitarian interest in
the fate of those affected.”10

UN human rights mecha-
nisms and development-
induced violations 

If UN agencies are not yet convinced
that development-induced displace-
ment often amounts to a human
rights violation, they should at least
use existing human rights mecha-
nisms to require governments to
provide information on the fate of
development-induced IDPs. Some of
the largest and most neglected devel-

opment-induced IDP populations are
found in countries which are State
Parties to important UN human rights
conventions. As part of the periodic
reporting and review process of the
implementation of these conventions,
the UN should solicit country-specific
information on forced displacement.
The Committee on Economic, Social
and Cultural Rights has included such
requests in their reporting guidelines
issued to states but has received very
little information on forced evictions.
Furthermore, in order to assess the

conditions under which these persons
are resettled (if at all), the fulfillment
of these citizens’ economic, social and
cultural rights after displacement
should also be analysed.

Article 12 of the UN International
Covenant on Civil and Political Rights
(ICCPR) covers the right to liberty of
movement and freedom to choose
one’s residence and the UN Human
Rights Committee is monitoring its
implementation. The Indian govern-
ment had to present its next periodic
report under the ICCPR before the
end of 2001 and should be encour-
aged to address the issue of those
who have had their right to freedom
of movement violated through forced
displacement. The Committee should
also request that NGOs, in accordance
with common practice, submit infor-
mation on this specific subject.

India is also a State Party to the
Convention on the Elimination of
Racial Discrimination. It should thus
be asked to explain to the Committee
on the Elimination of Racial
Discrimination why 40-50% of the
development-induced population is
made up of adivasi tribal people when
adivasis only comprise 8% of the
Indian population.11

China, which became a State Party to
the UN International Covenant on
Economic, Social and Cultural Rights
this year, will similarly have to report
on the status of these rights and
should be encouraged to address the
situation of forced evictions and
development-induced IDPs. As with
the ICCPR, it is common practice that
national and international NGOs
inform the members of the

Committee on Economic, Social and
Cultural Rights on issues of particular
importance for the fulfillment of
these rights. It would therefore be
appropriate for the Committee to
solicit and analyse reports from both
the government and from NGOs on
the consequences of large-scale devel-
opment projects in China. 

If these rights are being violated in
the context of internal displacement,
it would be useful for the Committee
members in their analysis and review

procedures to make use not just of
the relevant articles of Covenants
but also the UN Guiding Principles
on Internal Displacement. 

The increased attention to human
rights violations stemming from
development-induced displacement
does not have to be limited to these
three conventions. All six of the UN’s
treaty-monitoring bodies could be
used to gain a better understanding of
the phenomenon.12 Monitoring mecha-
nisms not linked to specific human
rights conventions (UN working
groups, special representatives and
special rapporteurs) should similarly
be encouraged to address the issue.

The Secretary General’s Represen-
tative on Internal Displacement
should play a key role in addressing
and clarifying the difference between
a development project of “overriding
public interest” which properly reset-
tles the displaced and a forced
displacement which violates interna-
tional human rights. Such guidance
would be well received by the interna-
tional community, currently confused
by the fact that the UN Guiding
Principles cover development-induced
displacement but the activities of the
Representative do not. 

Given his current workload and the
very limited resources at his disposal,
it would not be realistic to ask the
Representative to address country-
specific situations of development-
induced displacement. However, he
could play a very important role in
drawing the attention of the Working
Group of the UN Inter-Agency
Standing Committee to the plight of
development-induced IDPs. This
would enable appropriate member
agencies of the IASC to explore ways
of including development-induced
IDPs as beneficiaries of protection
and assistance activities.
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Such a human rights approach could
prove fruitful. State Parties to the
international Covenants have, of
their own free will, agreed to a
review of the implementation of
these human rights instruments. 
It has become common practice for
committees monitoring the Convent-
ions to include in their Concluding
Observations concrete recommen-
dations on how UN agencies can
contribute to an enhanced fulfilment
of specific rights. The Committees are
thus able to recommend that govern-
ments approach, for example, UNDP
to offer support for resettlement of
development-induced IDPs or UNHCR
to offer protection to this same popu-
lation. The international community is
beginning to recognise misguided
‘development projects’ which displace
millions of people and destroy their
livelihoods for what they really are:
violations of human rights.
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Norwegian Refugee Council’s
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